
From: McDougall, Robert
To: Neal Cornett
Subject: RE: Vermont Public Records Act Request
Date: Friday, February 21, 2020 4:44:00 PM

Attorney Cornett:  I wanted to give you an update on this request.  We are close to complete with
the processing and expect to have this out to you no later than the close of business Monday.

Sincerely,

Robert McDougall
Assistant Attorney General
 
 
 

From: Neal Cornett <ncornettlaw@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, February 13, 2020 10:23 AM
To: McDougall, Robert <robert.mcdougall@vermont.gov>
Subject: Re: Vermont Public Records Act Request
 
EXTERNAL SENDER: Do not open attachments or click on links unless you recognize and trust the
sender.
Excellent. Thank you.
 
On Thu, Feb 13, 2020 at 10:18 AM McDougall, Robert <robert.mcdougall@vermont.gov> wrote:

Hi Attorney Cornett:  I expect to have the 1.24.20 request materials out to Mr. Hardin today or
tomorrow.  I will include the cost associated with that one in the cover letter and you can follow
up with payment after you’ve received it.  I hope to have the 10.19.19 request materials together
to get to you next week and will include a cost statement in that cover as well. Thank you for
asking.
 
Once you/EPA have received the materials, please feel free to reach out with any questions.
 
Thanks,

Rob McDougall
 
 
 

From: Neal Cornett <ncornettlaw@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, February 13, 2020 10:14 AM
To: McDougall, Robert <robert.mcdougall@vermont.gov>
Subject: Re: Vermont Public Records Act Request
 
EXTERNAL SENDER: Do not open attachments or click on links unless you recognize and trust

mailto:robert.mcdougall@vermont.gov
mailto:ncornettlaw@gmail.com
mailto:robert.mcdougall@vermont.gov
mailto:ncornettlaw@gmail.com
mailto:robert.mcdougall@vermont.gov


the sender.
Mr. McDougall:
 
I hope you enjoyed your time out of the office. I wanted to circle back on the two requests of my
client, one from 10.14.19 and the other from 1.24.2020. Would you like for EPA to go ahead and
submit payment for both or how would you like to proceed?
 
Best,
Neal Cornett
 
On Fri, Jan 31, 2020 at 4:36 PM McDougall, Robert <robert.mcdougall@vermont.gov> wrote:

Attorney Cornett:  We normally seek advance payment of costs over $100, but because of the
uncertainty of exactly how much this will cost, I will proceed with the review and invoice you for
the cost with the production.  If it appears that the review will cost more than the $200
estimate, I will be back in touch before completing it.

Please be advised that I will be out of the office next week and will begin processing this
request when I return.

Sincerely,

Robert McDougall
 
 
 

From: Neal Cornett <ncornettlaw@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, January 31, 2020 4:10 PM
To: McDougall, Robert <robert.mcdougall@vermont.gov>
Subject: Re: Vermont Public Records Act Request
 
EXTERNAL SENDER: Do not open attachments or click on links unless you recognize and trust
the sender.
Mr. Dougall:
 
Thank you for your response. EPA is willing to pay for the review. Could you please provide
instructions for how to proceed?
 
Sincerely,
Neal Cornett
Attorney at Law
 
On Fri, Jan 31, 2020 at 3:55 PM McDougall, Robert <robert.mcdougall@vermont.gov> wrote:

Dear Attorney Cornett:  Please see the attached. 
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Sincerely
 
Robert McDougall
Assistant Attorney General
 

 
--
***The information contained in this message may be privileged. It is intended by the sender to
be confidential. If you suspect you may not be the intended recipient, please notify the sender
and delete all copies.***

 
--
***The information contained in this message may be privileged. It is intended by the sender to
be confidential. If you suspect you may not be the intended recipient, please notify the sender
and delete all copies.***

 
--
***The information contained in this message may be privileged. It is intended by the sender to be
confidential. If you suspect you may not be the intended recipient, please notify the sender and
delete all copies.***


