From: Clark, Charity

To: Jeffrey D. Bartley

Subject: RE: Settlement

Date: Thursday, October 22, 2020 5:16:50 PM
Attachments: Bartley PRA Letter 10.22.20.pdf

Please see attached.

From: Jeffrey D. Bartley <jeffreybartley@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 21, 2020 11:05 AM

To: Clark, Charity <Charity.Clark@vermont.gov>
Subject: Settlement

EXTERNAL SENDER: Do not open attachments or click on links unless you recognize and trust the
sender.
Good morning Charity -

What is the final amount | owe for my recent public records request? Whom do | make the check out
to and where do | send it? I'll get this out asap.

All the best,

Jeff Bartley

Jeffrey D. Bartley




THOMAS J. DONOVAN, JR.
ATTORNEY GENERAL

TEL: (802) 828-3171

http://www.ago.vermont.gov
JOSHUA R. DIAMOND
DEPUTY ATTORNEY GENERAL

SARAH E.B. LONDON
CHIEF ASST. ATTORNEY GENERAL

STATE OF VERMONT
OFFICE OF THE ATTORNEY GENERAL
109 STATE STREET
MONTPELIER, VT

05609-1001
October 22, 2020
Jeff Baﬂlei
Re: Vermont Public Records Act request, dated September 1, 2020

Dear Jeff:

I write in response to your e-mail inquiring about the final amount due on your request for public
records, dated September 1, 2020. The total cost to the Attorney General’s Office of complying
with your request was $444.99. In your request, you authorized us to complete work costing no
more than $500. Please send a check in the amount of $444.99 at your earliest convenience to
my attention at the following address:

Office of the Attorney General

109 State St.

Montpelier VT 05609

Attn: Charity R. Clark, Chief of Staff

Thank you.

Sincerely,

/s/
Charity R. Clark
Chief of Staff






